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E-BALL-0019 BALLAST120/277V ADVANCE 72C7984 NP 70W HPS S62 BULB 2 Each
ADV72C7984NP0

01
$70.08 $140.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0035 BALLAST-ELECTRONIC , 277V,4-F32T8RS 306 Each ADVICN4P32N $9.71 $2,971.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0044
BALLAST- HPS, MULTI, 120,208,240,277V, 1-100W-S-54 ADVANCE #71A8071-

001D QUADRI-VOLT BALLAST KIT
2 Each

ADV71A8071001

D
$38.16 $76.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0052
BALLAST, HPS, ADVANCE #72C8084-N-P FOR 1-100W-S54 BULB, HIGH 

PRESSURE
1 Each

ADV72C8084NP0

01
$67.09 $67.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0069
BALLAST- HPS, MULTI, 120,208,240,277V, 1-70W S-62, ADVANCE 71A7971-001D-

PART # 1A975 3 Each
ADV71A7971001

D
$40.25 $120.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0080
BALLAST- HPS, MULTI, REPLACEMENT KIT FOR 150W S-55, HIGH PRESSURE 

SODIUM CORE & COIL, ADVANCE #71A8172-001D-# 1A032 5 Each
ADV71A8172001

D
$43.32 $216.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0089

BALLAST- MET, HALIDE REPLACEMENT KIT FOR M-59-400W, MULTI, ADVANCE 

#71A6071-001D

Grainger# 1A029
13 Each

ADV71A6071001

D
$44.85 $583.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0112
BALLAST REL-4P32-SC 120V 4 BULB ELECTRONIC T8 BULBS ADVANCE-

GRAINGER PART #1VN22(OLD # 3V553) 1 Each ADVICN4P32N $9.71 $9.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0114
BALLAST VEL-2P59-S-RH-TP 277V 2 BULB F96T8

1 Each ADVIOP2P59N $15.68 $15.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0116
BALLAST REL3P32SC 120V 3 BULB T8 ELECTRONIC ADVANCE-OLD PART # 3V551-

NEW PART # 1VN21 1 Each ADVICN3P32N $8.71 $8.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0205
BALLAST- FLUORESCENT, ELECTRONIC 1 OR 2 TUBE, SINGLE, 277 VOLTS, 2- 

F32T8RS, ADVANCE VEL-2P32-SC- PART # 4PL80 NEW PART # 2MCX5 210 Each ADVICN2P32N $7.61 $1,598.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0206
BALLAST ADVANCE ICF-2S13-H1-LD

1 R2 13 WATT 4 PIN QUAD OR TRIPLE 1 Each
ADVICF2S13H1L

DK
$12.22 $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0208
BALLAST-1500 WATT-M48- MEATAL HALIDE-480 VOLT-60 HZ CWA-ADVANCE-

ADV100 ADVANCE # 71A6742-001-GRAINGER # 6CAT4 1 Each ADV71A6742001 $116.97 $116.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0260
BALLAST 277V ADVANCE 2 LAMP 110 WATT STANDARD VEL2S110-AND F48 HO

1 Each ADVICN2S110SC $24.22 $24.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0272
BALLAST ADVANCE ICF2S26H1LDK 2 LAMP, 120/277 VOLT 26 WATT; LEADS OUT 

OF SIDE-PART # 4ZZ35 2 Each
ADVICF2S26H1L

DK
$12.95 $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0276
BALLAST ADVANCE VEL-3P32-SC-277V FOR 3 F32T8 RS/15-OLD  PART # 3V552 

NEW PART # 1VN21 333 Each ADVICN3P32N $8.71 $2,900.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0280
BALLAST ADVANCE REL2P60S - 120V FOR 2 F96T12 SLIMLINE -NEW #4VMY6

UNIVOLT #ICN2P60SC 1 Each ADVICN2P60N $16.30 $16.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0282
BALLAST AC ELECTRONICS TSD-755PS 277V FOR 1 OR 2 FT55-# TSD-UV55PBXMS

26 Each
ADVICN2S5490C

N
$26.04 $677.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0283
BALLAST ADVANCE 175 W METAL HALIDE MULTI TAP-#3A531A

1 Each
ADV71A5570001

D
$33.76 $33.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0284
BALLAST ADVANCE 72C7884NP001 50W HPS

1 Each
ADV72C7884NP0

01
$152.39 $152.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0285
BALLAST ADVANCE 71A8080510D 100W HPS

1 Each $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0286
BALLAST-WORK HORSE-MODEL # WH5-120-L-THESE ARE FOR WEST & LAMBERT 

FREEZERS & COOLER 9 Each FULWH5120L $23.75 $213.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0343
100W HID BALLAST METAL HALIDE

71A5390-001D 1 Each
ADV71A5390001

D
$41.39 $41.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0345
250W HID BALLAST METAL HALIDE-#3A532A

1 Each
ADV71A5770001

D
$42.75 $42.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0347
400W HPS MULTI TAP INCLUDING 480V-PART # 1FYE1

53 Each
ADV71A8453001

D
$74.88 $3,968.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0351
HPS IGNITOR FOR 150W THROUGH 400W HPS BULBS-PART # 3A534

1 Each ADVLI501H4IC $25.78 $25.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0353
BALLAST 70W METAL HALIDE BALLAST KIT 71A5292-001D Grainger# 3LE31

1 Each
ADV71A5292001

D
$47.74 $47.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0355
BALLAST- FLUORESCENT ADVANCE V-2S40-TP 277V(2) T12

1 Each ADVICN2S40N $10.72 $10.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0363
BALLAST- FLUORESCENT ADVANCE R-2S40-TP 120V (2) T12 BULBS

1 Each ADVICN2S40N $10.72 $10.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0381
BALLAST HPS, MULTI 120, 208, 240, 277V 1-250W

2 Each
ADV71A8271001

D
$53.64 $107.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0387
BALLAST F96T12/HO REL2S110

1 Each ADVICN2S110SC $24.22 $24.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0390
ADVANCE 250 WATT METAL HALIDE ENCLOSED BALLAST 120/277 V

72C5782NP001 1 Each
ADV72C5782NP0

01
$86.41 $86.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0513
BALLAST-100 WATT METAL HILIDE  FOR A RECESSED LIGHT

ADVANCE # 72C5381-NP 1 Each
ADV72C5381NP0

01
$61.71 $61.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0514

BALLAST-1000 WATT HPS 480 VOLT

71A8743-001 ADVANCE

 GRAINGER PART#6V763

GOES TO E-BULB-0501

7 Each ADV71A8743001 $130.48 $913.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0515
BALLAST-ADVANCE-400 WATT-120/277 VOLT-HID-CAT # 72C6182-NP-METAL 

HALIDE-PULSE START 1 Each ADV72C6182NP $350.46 $350.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid

BALLAST
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E-BALL-0516
ADVANCE BALLEST-480 VOLT 100 WATT METAL HALIDE-#71A5340-T-(C.E.S PART # 

71A5340500DT) 1 Each
ADV71A5340500

DT
$193.39 $193.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0517
BALLAST-HID KIT CORE & COIL-1500W -277 VOLT-GRAINGER #1XWJ9

1 Each ADV71A6772001 $129.72 $129.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0518
WATTS STOPPER POWER PACK-120/230/277 WATTS BZ-50

1 Each WATBZ50 $23.26 $23.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0519

BALLAST FOR T5 LAMPS-ADVANCE

F54T5/HO

1CN2S54
13 Each ADVICN2S54T $11.63 $151.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0520

UNIVERSAL-ADVANCE SIGN BALLAST-ESB848-46-001

4,5 OR 6 T12HO 800M A LAMPS

120-277 VAC 50/60 HZ
1 Each ADVISB084846EI $58.78 $58.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0521
ADVANCE BALLAST KIT WITH BRACKET-ICF-2S42-M2LDK-120-277 42W

7 Each
ADVICF2S42M2L

DK
$15.25 $106.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0522
KEYSTONE BALLAST-#KTEB-218-UV-TP-PIC-DW 60HZ 120V/0.38A THRU 277V/ 

0.17A 11 Each
ADVICF2S18H1L

DK
$12.22 $134.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0524
LED DRIVER D15CC55UNVTZ-C INPUT 120 TO 277 VOLTS 50/60HZ

23 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0525
PHILLIPS ADVANCE XITAINIUM LED DRIVER 120-277V 27-54VDC 

X1040C110V054BPT1 16 Each
ADVXI040C110V

054BPT1M
$56.35 $901.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0526
GYMS, 2 X 2 LAY-IN HOWARD FIXTURES DRIVER MADE BY THOMAS RESEARCH

27 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0528
SWITCH-HITTER AC-50CD1.4UV-TS LED DRIVER

21 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-BATT-0141 BATTERY-6 VOLT, 7AHP-POWER SONIC 

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid SLA0925 $12.69 $25.38

E-BATT-0168 BATTERY 12V 7AHR OR BATTERY 12V 8 AHR 

SAME SIZE-POWER SONIC-BATTERY FOR INTRUSION & FIRE ALARMS 230 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid FAS1075 $15.69 $3,608.70

E-BATT-0169 BATTERY 6V 4.5AHR-POWER SONIC

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid FAS0905 $7.69 $7.69

E-BATT-0170 LANTERN BATTERIES-

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid DRY1403 $2.89 $2.89

E-BATT-0171 RECHARGABLE BATTERY PACK FOR EXIT LIGHT-

BCN800-2DWP 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid NIC0061 $9.95 $9.95

E-BATT-0172 BATTERY-FOR PLASTIC EXIT LIGHTS

ELB121017 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid ASC0085 $2.69 $2.69

E-BATT-0174 1.2 VOLT 1100 MAH WITH PLUG BATTERY

(MOSTLY GOES TO EXIT LIGHTS IN TRAILERS)

BCN1100WP-GRAYBAR # BON1100WP-GRAINGER # 2XLD7
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid NIC1169 $12.69 $12.69

E-BATT-0175 ENERGIZER LITHUM  PHOTO BATTERIES-3.0 VOLT-(2 PER PACK)

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid PHO0015-2 $3.50 $3.50

E-BATT-0176 BATTERY-6 VOLT 7 AHP-POWER SONIC 

20 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid SLA0925 $12.69 $253.80

E-BATT-0177 UPS AND FIRE ALARM-REPLACEMENT BATTERIES-APC 1500

(TAKES 2 12 VOLT 18 AMP TO MAKE ONE) 40 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid SLA1116 $39.69 $1,587.60

E-BATT-0178 3.6 VOLT BATTERY 2100MAH LITHIUM-PART # LITHLS14500BA

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid LIT2061 $4.62 $9.24

E-BATT-0180 BATTERY 6 VOLT 2.8 AH-INTERNET COMMUCATION

9 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid SLA0902 $9.50 $85.50

E-BATT-0181 12V 4.5AH BATTERIES SLA .187 FASTON **INTERSTATE SEC1050**

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid FAS1055 $10.69 $21.38
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E-BOX-0109 BOX- EXTENSION, 4" X 4", KO 1/2" & 3/4", 1 1/2" DEEP, RACO #203

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BOX-0126 BOX- SQUARE, 4" X 4", KNOCKOUTS 1/2" & 3/4", 1 1/2" DEEP (RACO #192)

90 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BOX-0157 BOX WEATHER PROOF OUTLET WITH 1/2" OPENING-1G

11 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-BULB-0390 150/Q/DC/130 7613-PART # 2V703 ESAM#58270
1 Each VOSETC $5.18 $5.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0391 LED WHITE E12 120WATT-T20E12-120W  E SAM# LEDT20E12-120W
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0392 MXR32/C/VBU/O-PART # 1E279
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0393 QF100 1000W FEL 1000 FEC-PART # 4V251 E SAM#54570
6 Each VOSFEL $10.36 $62.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0396 BULB 25W MEDIUM BASE T10CL25-PART # 4V461 ESAM# 18510
1 Each GNC25T10CL $0.88 $0.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0397 BULB T10CL40 MEDIUM BASE-PART # 4V879  E SAM#18652
1 Each PHLBC40T10 $0.69 $0.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0398 BULB GE #64 BAYONET (TWIST IN) BASE-PART # 6VC47 E SAM#64
1 Each MIN64 $0.37 $0.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0400 METAL HALIDE BULB 100W MEDIUM BASE-PART # 2F944 E SAM #46136
14 Each

PHLMHC100U

MP3KELITE
$21.38 $299.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0402 MINI FLUORESCENT BULB 18W 2 PIN CF18DD/841 (CF18DD/E/835)-PART # 

1PGW9 E SAM 32018Q35K 1 Each
PHLPLC18W41A

LTO
$3.91 $3.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid

BATTERY

BOX

BULB



E-BULB-0403 METAL HALIDE 175 W MEDIUM BASE M175UMED E SAM#64479
11 Each PHLMH175UM $12.15 $133.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0404 MERCURY VAPOR 100W MOGUL BASE  LAMP HR100DX38-PART # 2V477
2 Each

PHLH38JA100D

X
$10.52 $21.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0405 MECURY VAPOR 175W MOGUL BASE LAMP HR175/DX/39-PART # 5V686 E SAM 

#69445 1 Each
PHLH39KC175D

X
$6.10 $6.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0406 MINI FLUORESCENT BULB 13W CF13DD/835/ECO (SYLVANIA) 

F13DBX23/841/ECO (GE) E SAM#21118 1 Each
PHLPLC13W35

USAALTO
$2.81 $2.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0408 F13DBX/841/ECO4P (GE)-*4 PIN*-PART # 1PGW5 DIMMABLE ESAM 

#CF13DD/E/835 1 Each
PHLPLC13W414

PALTO
$2.72 $2.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0410 15T6 130V T6CL15-PART # 1E545 ESAM#18038
1 Each PHL15T6150V $0.75 $0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0411 20T 6 1/2 CL (BULB T6.5CL20INT 130V)-PART # 4V479 E SAM#4316
1 Each PHL20T612IF $0.89 $0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0413 500T3QCL 130V (BULB 500W T3Q/P/CL 125/130V QUARTZ HALOGEN) 

Q500T2,5/CL-PART # 2V384 ESAM#58996 1 Each
PHL500T3QPCL

120V
$2.56 $2.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0414 50PAR20/CAP/SPL/NFL30 130V-50PAR 20H FL25 130-PART # 4V101 E SAM 

#16109 40 Each
PHL39PAR20EV

PFL
$3.87 $154.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0418 60W 130V-PART # 5V598 E SAM #20812
50 Each PHL43A19EV $2.10 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0419 BULB 6S6 130V (S6 6W)-12 BULBS IN ONE BOX- PART # 4V443 E SAM#16938
1 Each PHL6S6 $0.29 $0.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0421 800W QUARTZ HALOGEN DXX  ESAM# E DXX
1 Each VOSDXX $10.98 $10.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0424 CF18DD/E/835 OR F18/DBX/SPX841/840/4P (1E593)-PART # 1PGZ6
43 Each

PHLPLC18W414

PALTO
$3.91 $168.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0425 MINI FLUORESCENT F26DBX/841/ECO (BULB 26W 2 PIN (GRAINGER #1PGY3) E 

SAM# 21115 1 Each
PHLPLC26W41A

LTO
$3.91 $3.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0429 CF7DS/835 -- F7BX/841 OR F7BX/SPX35-PART # 1PGT5 ESAM#21274
1 Each

PHLPLS7W8412

PALTO
$1.45 $1.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0430 CF9DD/835 -- F9BX/835 OR F9BX/SPX35-PART # 1PGT8 ESAM#21273
1 Each GEF9BX835ECO $1.58 $1.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0431 EHD500-500W -- EHD Q 500CL/TP-PART # 5V592 ESAM#54508
1 Each USHEHD $14.21 $14.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0432 EHG750 750W -- HHGQ750CL/TP-PART # 5V593 ESAM#54512
7 Each VOSEHG $15.49 $108.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0434 F17T8/SP41/ECO-PART # 6XT99 ESAM#FF17T8/741K
3 Each

PHLF17T8TL841

ALTO
$2.96 $8.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0435 F25T8/SPX41/ECO-PART # 6XV07
49 Each

PHLF25T8TL841

ALTO
$2.52 $123.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0436 FO32/735 -- F32T8/SP41/ECO-PART # 4PL16 ESAM#F32T8/741K
1 Each

PHLF32T8TL941

ALTO
$1.29 $1.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0438 F096/735-T8 8 INCH SINGLE PIN BULB-PART # 2D049 ESAM#21737
1 Each

PHLF96T8TL835

PLUSALTO
$5.93 $5.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0439 MINI FLUORESCENT F13BX/841/ECO ESAM#21137
10 Each

PHLPLS13W841

2PALTO
$1.45 $14.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0440 13W F13DBX/841/ECO ESAM#97588
1 Each

PHLPLC13W41

USAALTO
$2.81 $2.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0442 MINI FLUORESCENT F26DDX835/4P/EOL (BULB 26W 4 PIN) (CF26DD/E/841)-

PART # 1PGY7/E SAM # 20669 24 Each
PHLPLC26W414

PALTO
$3.91 $93.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0443 F30T12/CW/RS 30W FL 2' -- F25T12/CW/RS/WM-PART # 4V610 ESAM#23476
30 Each

PHLF30T12CWR

SALTO
$2.15 $64.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0446 F48T12/CW/HO 60W FL 4' FREEZER & COOLER-BULBS-BLACK FLAT TIP-PART 

# 3V443-

****DO NOT RE-ORDER T12****** ESAM#25146

89 Each
PHLF48T12CWH

OALTO
$3.37 $299.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0447 150 PAR/FL/BLUE 130V-PART # 1E033 ESAM#19465

1 Each GE150PARFLB $32.65 $32.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0449 F64T12/CW/H0-PART # 4V937 ESAM#25352
1 Each

GEF64T12CWH

O
$6.26 $6.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0450 F8T5/CW-THESE CAN ONLY BE ORDERED IN A CASE-BUT WE CHARGE OUT 

AS EACH-PART # 2V235 ESAM#21366 1 Each PHLF8T5CW $1.59 $1.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0451 F96T12/CW/HO/SS 95 WATT-PART # 3V351 ESAM#25134

25 Each
PHLF96T12CWH

OOALTO
$3.95 $98.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0452 F96T12/CW 60W-PART# 3V480 E SAM #29478

1 Each
PHLF96T12CWS

UPREMEALTO
$4.55 $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0453 F31T8/SPX41/U-PART # 2ETT9 E SAM 21878
30 Each

PHLFB31T8TL84

1ALTO
$6.98 $209.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0454 FBO32/841 FL U SHAPE OCTAGON F32T8/SPX41/U/6-GRAINGER PART # 3V977 

E SAM#F32T8/835K/U6 44 Each
PHLFB32T8TL84

16ALT
$6.59 $289.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0456 FT18/DL/841 OR F18BX/841-PART # 6V033 ESAM#20589

1 Each PHLPLL18W41 $7.33 $7.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0457 FT55/DL/841 -- F55BX/841-PART # 67533 ESAM#20592

125 Each SYLFT55DL841 $6.78 $847.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0458 150 PAR/FL/GREEN 130V0-GRAINGER # 1E030 E SAM#19467

1 Each GE150PARFLG $38.25 $38.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0459 BULB GE #455 ESAM#455
1 Each MIN455 $0.47 $0.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0460 BULB GE #7613-PART # 6VK92 E SAM 7613
1 Each MIN7613 $8.18 $8.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0461 BULB GE #787-PART # 1C393 E SAM #787
1 Each MIN787 $6.54 $6.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0462 BULB GE #908 6V 1.50A-PART # 6YF20 ESAM#908

1 Each MIN908 $0.35 $0.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0463 BULB GE #909-6V 0.62A-PART # 1C304 E SAM #909
1 Each MIN909 $0.37 $0.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid



E-BULB-0464 GE 912-GRAINGER PART # 3BB25 ESAM#912
1 Each MIN912 $0.37 $0.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0465 BULB GE #915-PART # 1C300 E SAM#44771
1 Each MIN915 $0.38 $0.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0466 GE 927-PART # 1E538 E SAM # 927
1 Each MIN927 $0.51 $0.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0467 H33GL 400/DX -- HR 400 DX 33-PART  2V358 E SAM #69450
1 Each

PHLH33GL400D

X
$11.15 $11.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0468 HPL 575 WATT  130V-PART # 1E942 NEW PN #3DXR4 Projector lamp E SAM # 

1000543 1 Each
USHHPL575120

V
$17.09 $17.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0469 150 PAR/FL/RED 130V-PART 3 1E028 E SAM #19468
1 Each GE150PARFLR $38.25 $38.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0470 HPS LU100/MED (BULB 100W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 4V604 E SAM #67506
32 Each PHLC100S54M $7.98 $255.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0471 HPS LU100/MOG (BULB 100W HPS MOGUL BASE)-PART  2V519-NEW PART # 

2VAD5 E SAM#67514 37 Each
PHLC100S54ALT

O
$10.23 $378.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0472 HPS LU150/MOG (BULB 150W HPS MOGUL BASE) LU/150/55-PART # 2V452 E 

SAM #67516 7 Each
PHLC150S55ALT

O
$7.94 $55.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0473 HPS LU150/MED (BULB 150W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 2V713/E SAM #67508
3 Each PHLC150S55M $7.94 $23.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0474 HPS LU250 (BULB 250W HPS MOGUL BASE BULB)-PART # 2V520NEW # 3APT5 

ESAM#67578 9 Each
PHLC250S50ALT

O
$7.94 $71.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0475 HPS LU400 BULB 400W HPS MOGUL BASE-PART # 2V453-NEW PART # 3APT6/ 

E SAM #67533
108 Each

PHLC400S51ALT

O
$7.94 $857.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0476 HPS LU50/MED (BULB 50W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 2V657 ESAM#67502
1 Each PHLC50S68M $10.98 $10.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0477 LU50/MOG-PART # 1C292 ESAM#67510
1 Each

PHLC50S68ALT

O
$15.41 $15.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0478 HPS LU70/MED (BULB 70W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 2V632 ESAM#67504
41 Each PHLC70S62M $7.98 $327.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0479 HPS LU70/MOG (BULB 70W HPS MOGUL BASE) ESAM#67512
8 Each

PHLC70S62ALT

O
$7.94 $63.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0480 150/Q/CL/DL 130V -- Q150CL/MC (ETG)-PART # 2V701 ESAM#Q150CL/MC/2V-

130V 1 Each VOSETG $6.80 $6.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0481 METAL HALIDE M175/U (BULB 175W  MOGUL BASE) MVR175/U-PART # 4V550 

ESAM#MH175/U 1 Each PHLMH175U $11.10 $11.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0482 METAL HALIDE M250/U (BULB 250W MOGUL BASE) MVR250/U-PART # 2V712 

ESAM#MH250/U 54 Each PHLMH250U $10.22 $551.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0483 METAL HALIDE M400/U (BULB 400W MOGUL BASE) MVR400/U-SYLVANIA # 

6449-0 CLEAR ONLY ESAM#64036 171 Each PHLMH400UE $10.94 $1,870.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0487 METAL HALIDE MXR50/U/MED/O 50W MEDIUM BASE MXR50/U/MED/O-PART # 

6XT91 

ESAM #MP50/U/MED/3K

1 Each
PHLMHC50UM

P3KELITE
$25.41 $25.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0488 METAL HALIDE MVR70/U/MED 70W MEDIUM BASE MVR70/U/MED-PART 3 

1E694 ESAM#MP70/U/MED/3K 1 Each
PHLMHC70UM

4KELITE
$16.85 $16.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0489 GE- BULB 26 WATT 1700 LUMENS- (USED FOR VENT HOOD)- E. SAM JONES #  

29026-1 79 Each PHLELMDT23W $3.10 $244.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0490 GE- ROUGH SERVICE COVERGUARD-60 WATT - A-19 UTILITY BULB-COATED-2 

BULBS PER PACK. PART # 5V763-NEW # 4HCL3 ESAM#10503 1 Each PHL60ATF $1.01 $1.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0491 BULB-60 WATT COATED MEDIUM BASE (HOT PASS THROUGH) ESAM#6147 

67 Each PHL60ATF $1.01 $67.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0493 32 WATT BULB-4 PIN FLOURESCENT SCF32DT/E/IN/841-PART # 1PHA5 

ESAM#20886 10 Each
PHLPLT32W841

A4PALTO
$5.10 $51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0496 T-12 U SHAPE OCTAGON F35CW/U/6/WM-PART # 3V528 ESAM#24004 
1 Each

PHLFB40T12CW

SUPREME6ALT

O

$5.89 $5.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0499 PLEXI GLASS 2X4 LAY IN LENS NOTE: WANT THICKER LENS-ORDER FROM  

E.SAM JONES-PART # PSP.125 10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0501 BULB 1000 WATT ESAM#67307 
16 Each

PHLC1000S52AL

TO
$39.81 $636.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0504 PHILLIPS-T3-WORK AND SECURITY LAMP-HALO QUARTZS-300 WATT-120 

VOLTS-LOWE'S PART # 18833-GRAINGER # 2CVB6 ESAM#58998 1 Each
PHLBC300T3QC

LTP
$1.65 $1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0505 METAL HALIDE-HID LAMP- 1500  WATT-GENERAL ELECTRIC-GRAINGER # 

4V484 NOTE: THESE ARE STATIUM LAMPS--MUST STAY WITH G.E. 

GE#GMVR1500/U/SPORT  E SAM # 47326

8 Each
GEMVR1500US

PORTS
$27.10 $216.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0506 LAMPS FOR A SALSD COOLER-HER/FO21/865/XP/ECO-HERITAGE LIGHT BULB 

6500K E SAM#21730 14 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0508 F54T5/841/HO/ECO/ICEA 4' T5 HIGH OUTPUT/E SAM #21043
144 Each

PHLF54T5841H

OALTO
$3.25 $468.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0509 BTN 120 VOLT 750 WATT ESAM#54687
1 Each VOSBTN $16.90 $16.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0511 42 WATT LAMP-F42TBX/841/A-ECO-GRAINGER # 1PHA9-THESE BULS GO TO 

LAMBERT H.S. E SAM#20890 37 Each
PHLPLT42W841

A4PALTO
$5.81 $214.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0512 MP400/BU 400W METAL HALIDE WITH EXTENDED TIP BASE CLEAR ONLY 

SYLVANIA E SAM#64705 18 Each PHLMP400BU $26.79 $482.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0513 BTL-500 WATT -T6-BASE-P27S-120 VOLTS-CLEAR- E SAM #54685
16 Each VOSBTL $13.29 $212.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0514 HPL 575  115 VOLT
10 Each

USHHPL575115

V
$17.09 $170.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0516 SYLVANIA-LED MEDIUM BASE BULB=#78807-(LONG LASTING TO GO WHERE 

THE PAR 90'S GO) E SAM#19PAR38G3DlM/830FL40 38 Each
PHLLEDPAR38F

L83014WDG
$7.38 $280.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0517 F20T12CW-BULBS-20 WATT-GRAINGER # 6NB14 E SAM # 22078
1 Each

PHLF20T12CWA

LTO
$1.79 $1.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0518 COATED LAMP FOR SERVING LINE F15T8-CW-SY-PSG ADVANTECH SAFTY 

GUARDED-ITEM # 21616 E SAM # F15T8CW 7 Each
GNCF15T8CWT

F
$2.94 $20.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid



E-BULB-0520 HPL 750/115/X (UFC) 750 WATT 115 VOLT G9.5 W/HIS OSRAM NAED 54611 E 

SAM #54611
6 Each

USHHPL750115

X
$17.09 $102.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0521 FLK 575 115V G9.5 E SAM #1000543
26 Each VOSFLK $11.40 $296.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0522 SYLVANIA LAMP-10038 120/CS S15A15 130V E SAM #10038
1 Each GNC15A15 $0.61 $0.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0523 VULCAN LAMP AND HOLDER FOR A VULCAN OVEN-VH357036-1 40W 120V
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0524 F21T5/830/ECO/TF TEFLON COATED LAMP 
4 Each

PHLF21T5830AL

TOTF
$12.35 $49.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-COIL-0001 SQUARE D COIL FOR 12 POLE CONTACTOR-277V COIL-PART # FOPR THE COIL 

9998LH55 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-COIL-0002 COIL FOR 4 POLE CONTACTOR 24V~60HZ AC 9998L23

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-COIL-0003 COIL FOR 12 POLE CONTACTOR 24V~60HZ AC 9998LH23

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-COND-0296 CONDUIT- EMT ID -1/2", 10' LENGTHS, 

( 10-STRAPPED PER BUNDLE) 35 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-COND-0306 CONDUIT- EMT ID 3/4", 10' PER STICK,

6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-COND-0356 CONDUIT- SEALTITE, 1/2", EF 100 FT ROLL, MOISTURE & OIL PROOF, PVC 

JACKETED-PART # PANPLT2SC 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-COND-0357 CONDUIT- SEALTITE 3/4", EF 100 FT ROLL, MOISTURE & OIL PROOF, PVC 

JACKETED 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FLEX-0317 CONDUIT- FLEXIBLE 1/2", ALUMINUM, 100 FT ROLL

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FLEX-0328 CONDUIT- FLEXIBLE 3/8", ALUMINUM, 100 FT ROLL

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-DEV-0301 RECEPTACLE GFCI WHITE P&S 2094-W, 20 AMP
2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0026 PLUG ELECTRICAL- FEMALE CORD, HUBBELL 5369-CY, 20 AMP, 125 VOLT, 2 

POLE,  3 WIRE, STRAIGHT, NEMA 5-20R 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0027 PLUG ELECTRICAL- MALE CORD GE #GED0521, 20 AMP, 125 VOLT, 3 WIRE, 

STRAIGHT, YELLOW, NEMA 5-20P 17 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0028 PLUG ELECTRICAL- MALE CORD HUBBELL 5266-CY, 15 AMP, 125 VOLT, 3 WIRE, 

STRAIGHT BLADE, NEMA 5-15P 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0029 RECEPTACLE- DUPLEX BROWN, SIDE & BACK WIRED, 20 AMPS, 125V, 2 POLE, 3 

WIRE, NEMA #6-20R BROWN 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0050 SWITCH- SINGLE POLE, 20 AMP, SPST, 277 VOLT, BROWN W/ GROUND SCREW, 

PASS & SEYMORE CS20AC1 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0051 PN #1221-2L LEVITON (ONLY)  BROWN, LOCKING SWITCH SINGLE POLE, 20 

AMP, KEY, 277 VOLT 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0053 SWITCH- SINGLE POLE, 20 AMP, SP KEY, 120/277 VOLT, KEY OPERATED, NO 

GROUND SCREW, IVORY, LEVITON #1221-21L 19 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0054 SWITCH- SINGLE POLE,  20 AMP, SPST, 125/277 VOLT, IVORY, W/ GROUND 

SCREW, HUBBELL 1221-1G OR P & S # CS20AC1-1-LEVITON # CS120-21 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0055 SWITCH- 3 WAY, 20 AMP, 125/277 VOLT, IVORY, W/ GROUND SCREW, HUBBELL 

1223-1G 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0084 20 AMP-DUPLEX-RECEPT.- ISOLATED GROUND-ORANGE- P&S # IG6300-NOT 

HOSPITAL GRADE-P & S # IG8300=HOSPITAL GRADE 9 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0085 20 AMP GFCI DUPLEX RECEPT IVORY-P & S 2095-1 (USE TO BE A 2094-1)-LEVITON 

# 7899-I 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0088 20 AMP 120/277V LOCKING SWITCH SPEC GRADE GRAY-SINGLE POLE- PART # 

LEV12032L-PART # FOR P & S #PS20AC1-L 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0218 SWITCH 4 WAY IVORY P&S CS420-I 20 AMP
17 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0219 GREY SINGLE POLE SWITCH 120/277 VOLT

20 AMP. 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0221 SWITCH-GREY 3 WAY TOGGLE 20 AMP 120/277 VAC
11 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0222 ANGLE PLUG 3 WIRE GROUNDING 5A-125 VOLT ROTATING POSITIONS-P & S # 

PS5266-SSAN-LOWE'S #5867AN COOPER 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0223 SWITCH- SINGLE POLE PILOT SWITCH-20 AMP 120 VAC-BACK & SIDE WIRE-

PS20AC1-RPL-(RED)-LEVITON # 1221-7PR 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0233 DOOR BELLS-TA340-6N5 TORK ALERT

500-648416T-GOES WITH E-DEVI-0234 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0234 PUSH BUTTON SWITCH-OPEN-MOMENTARY

76070PS-GOES WITH E-DEVI-0233 43 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0257 20 AMP COMMERCIAL GRADE DUPLEX RECEPT IVORY P & S CR20-I
32 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

COILS

CONDUIT

DEVICES



E-DEVI-0263 20 AMP- DUPLEX-RECEPT- ISOLATED GROUND-RED-P&S #IG6300-RED-NOT 

HOSPITAL GRADE P&S # IG8300-RED-HOSPITAL GRADE 16 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0268 20 AMP GRAY DUPLEX RECEPTACLE COM. GRADE P & S CR20-GRY
4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0291 SWITCH SECURITY 1 POLE P & S 20AC1-KL 20AMP
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0292 SWITCH MANUAL CONTROLLER P & S 1251-L 20AMP
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0293 SWITCH BROWN 3 WAY P&S CS20AC3 20AMP
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0299 20 AMP-DUPLEX-RECEPT-ISOLATED GROUND-IVORY-P&S#IG6300-I=NOT 

HOSPITAL GRADE-P&S # IG8300-I=HOSPITAL GRADE

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0300 RECEPTACLE GFCI BROWN P&S 2095 20AMP

(USE TO BE 2094)-LEVITON # 7899
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0350 3 WAY 20 AMP SWITCH WITH KEY..

BROWN-LEVITON-#1223-2L 10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0352 P & S-SWITCH-3-WAY SECURITY SWITCH

20A 120/277 V SPECIFICATION GRADE

20AC3-KL-2KL
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0353 LEVITON LOCKING SWITCH KEYS-#55500-PRT

10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0354 COVER SWITCH-STANDARD-2 GANG-S.S. FINISH
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0355 P & s 20 AMP 120/277V LOCKING SWITCH-SPEC GRADE-IVORY-SINGLE POLE

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0357 LEVITON-20 AMP SINGLE POLE 120/277V LOCKING- GREY
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0358 LEVITON 3 WAY 20 AMP LOCKING SWITCH-GREY
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0359 LEVITON 3 WAY 20 AMP LOCKING SWITCH-IVORY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0360 P & S 3 WAY 20 AMP LOCKING SWITCH-IVORY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0361 P & S 3 WAY 20 AMP LOCKING SWITCH-GREY
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0363 LEVITON SECURITY SWITCH SINGLE POLE 20 AMP
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DEVI-0364 LEVITON-SECURITY SWITCH-3-WAY  

20A 120/277 V SPECIFICATION GRADE 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-DRYR-0001 BOBRICK HAND DRYER MOTION SENSOR-PART #700-360-THIS PART # IS FOR A 

115 VOLT ONLY 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0002 JETAIR HAND DRYER-MOTION SENSOR-THIS GOES IN A MODEL # 1522-(WHITCH 

IS NO LONGER MADE) MOD # V1522EA SERIAL # J5009

240 VOLTS
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0003 WORLD HAND DRYER-BRADLY-SWITCH TIMER KIT-208-230 VOLT-125K-PART # 

125A-K 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0005 213A7 HEAT COILS FOR WORLD DRYER 277V 2100W

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0006 SENSOR ASSY. KIT FOR A WORLD HAND DRYER-277 VOLT PART # 16-240-277AK

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0007 SENSOR ASSY. KIT FOR A WORLD HAND DRYER 120 VOLT 16-230-120AK

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0008 THERMAL DISC FOR A WORLD HAND DRYER PART #1111-03
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0009 SENSOR FOR A WORLD HAND DRYER-XA57 237BWK
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0010 HAND DRYER CIRCUIT BOARD ITEM # 55-055625K HAND DRYER TIMER BOARD 

RETROFIT

CIRCT. BRD. TIMER ASSY.
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0011 BOBRICK HAND DRYER-INFARRED SIENSOR B750360   115V
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0012 BRADLEY HAND DRYER-HEATING ELEMENT/COIL MOD:BA53 208 VOLT 

GRAINGER # 6058034 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0013 BRADLEY HAND DRYER 125-K -SWITCH TIMMER UNIT. PUSH BUTTON TIMER 

MOTOR-110-120 VOLT

GRAINGER #5125620-ALLIED # 125K
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-DRYR-0014 115 VOLT HEATING ELEMENT/COIL FOR HAND DRYER ALLIED PART # 213
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-EXIT-0001 EMERGENCY EXIT COMBO #73030

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-EXIT-0002 EMERGENCY EXIT LIGHT-BLACK BACK WITH BRUSHED ALUM. FACE-BATTERY 

BACK UP. 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DRYERS

EXIT SIGNS



E-EXIT-0003 EMERGENCY EXIT-BUG EYE ONLY-SQHO-12-54-2-WITH12 V 7AH BATTERY BACK 

UP

ARC-MORRIS # 73120
24 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-EXIT-0004 EXIT LIGHT LESB1R 120/277-NO BATTERY BACK UP-BLACK BACK WITH 

BRUSHED ALUM. FACE 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-EXIT-0005 EXIT LIGHT CXLA1RW(WHITE)-NO BATTERY BACK UP
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-EXIT-0006 LED REPLACEMENT FOR EXIT LIGHTS ELP L013
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-FITT-0022 PLUG- KNOCKOUT, 1/2" SNAP-IN RACO #1042
26 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0025 PLUG- KNOCKOUT, 3/4", SNAP-IN RACO #1043
17 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0130 MC CABLE CONNECTOR STRAIGHT 3/8" (THESE ARE PRICED OUT EACH NOT 

BOXES) 126 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0361 CONNECTOR- CONDUIT, RACO #2913, STEEL, EMT 3/4", COMPRESSION
10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0362 CONNECTOR- CONDUIT, RACO #2912, STEEL, EMT 1/2", COMPRESSION-(PRICED 

OUT EACH NOT PER BOX) 56 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0373 COUPLING- CONDUIT, RACO #2922, STEEL, EMT 1/2", COMPRESSION
27 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0374 COUPLING- CONDUIT, RACO #2923, STEEL, EMT 3/4" COMPRESSION
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0375 SEAL TIGHT CONNECTOR-1/2 STRAIGHT
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-FITT-0376 1/2 90 SEALTIGHT CONNECTORS
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0064 TERMINAL- WIRE CONNECTOR, IDEAL 30-072, (100 Per Pack), WIRE NUT, BLUE
46 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0065 TERMINAL-WIRE-CONNECTORE, IDEAL #30-454-(25 Per Pack)-WIRE NUTS-BIG 

BLUE ONES 1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0147 WIRE NUTS RED IDEAL #30-452 (100 Per Pack)

MUST BE WING NUTS 1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0148 WIRE NUTS YELLOW IDEAL #30-451 (100 Per Pack)

MUST BE WING NUTS 2 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0149 WIRE NUTS ORANGE- IDEAL #30-073 (100 Per Pack)
4 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0150 WIRE NUTS GRAY IDEAL # 30-342 (50 Per Pack)

(IDEA 30-342) 1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0151 WIRE NUTS  IDEAL #30-341 TAN WIRE NUTS (100 Per Pack)
6 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-NUTS-0199 WIRE NUTS GRAY-IDEAL # 30-071 (100 Per Pack)
1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-KEYS-0001 KEYS FOR A P & S 20AC1-KL-GOES WITH OUR  PART # E-DEVI-0352-J & M PART # 

4609 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-KEYS-0002 P & S LOCK SWITCH KEY-500K-(STAR KEY)

5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-KEYS-0003 LEVITON KEY-2KL (WS-35)

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-KILN-0001 THERMOCOUPLE FOR KILN-KM THERMICOUOP ELEMENT ONLY-1515

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0001 ANCHOR- PLASTIC ANCHORING KIT IN PLASTIC BOX W/ 100- 1/4" WALL ANCHORS 

& 100- #10 X 1" SCREWS-JOHNSTONE # 46296 NEW # 326631 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0002 SPLICE KIT-NSI SKAB-2

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0004 OUTLET SPACERS-IDEAL #772451l-(25 TO A PACK)

1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0011 MARKER BOOKS FOR MARKING WIRE 44-103

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0042 WIRING CORD FOR EL DEVICE

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0121 HPS IGNITOR FOR 35W THRU 150W HPS BULBS

1 Each ADVLI551H4IC $31.78 $31.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0258 CHAIN- JACK, SIZE #12, CADIUM PLATED, LOAD LIMIT- 6 LBS PER 100, 100 FT PER 

BOX (ELLIOTT #758) 1 Box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0261 EXIT LIGHT CXLA1RW(WHITE)-NO BATTERY BACK UP

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0262 EXIT LIGHT LESB1R 120/277-NO BATTERY BACK UP-BLACK BACK WITH BRUSHED 

ALUM. FACE 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0263 RUST-OLEUM STOPS RUST-#7747 SUNBRUST YELLOW

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0264 SURGE PROTECTOR FOR ACCESS CONTROL-DVR'S # DTK-1F

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0276 SURGE PROTECTORS FOR STADIUM SOUNDS SYSTEMS. 90 VOLT-DK-

2MHLP90BW2 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FITTINGS /NUTS

MISCELLANOUS 



E-MISC-0277 THERMAL DISC FOR A WORLD HAND DRYER

PART #1111-03 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0278 SENSOR FOR A WORLD HAND DRYER-XA57

237BWK 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0280 IDEAL CLEAR GLIDE-1 QUART

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0283 HAND DRYER CIRCUIT BOARD

ITEM # 55-055625K

HAND DRYER TIMER BOARD RETROFIT

CIRCT. BRD. TIMER ASSY.

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0284 SQUARE D CONTACTOR 12 POLE #V8903

120 VOLT COIL-8903LG0012V02-ELECTRICALY HELD CONTACTOR 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0285 BOBRICK HAND DRYER-INFRARED SENSOR

B750360   115V 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0286 SURGE PROTECTION-DITEK WITH BASE FOR FIRE ALARMS-DTK-2MHLP-24B-WB

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0287 ACRYLIC WRAP AROUND LENS FOR A 4 LAMP SURFACE MOUNT LIGHT. LITHONIA

(MOSTLY TRAILORS)-13 3/4 X 2 7/8 X48' 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0289 BRADLEY HAND DRYER-HEATING ELEMENT

MOD:BA53 208 VOLT

GRAINGER # 6058034
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0290 BRADLEY HAND DRYER-SWITCH TIMMER UNIT.

PUSH BUTTON TIMMER MOTOR-110-120 VOLT

GRAINGER #5125620-ALLIED # 125K
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0293 DYTEC SURGE PROTECTOR-# DK-4LVLPLV

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0505 LED REPLACEMENT FOR EXIT LIGHTS ELP L013

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0507 RIB2402SB SPST-NO POWER RELAY W/SW RIBS

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0509 BOARD FOR CHLORIDE EXIT LIGHT CXLAIRA 4943

16 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0511 SQUARE D- BREAKER-SINGLE POLE-20 AMP. 277 VOLT-TYPE FA-C PHASE-

FY14020C 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0512 SQUARE D- BREAKER-SINGLE POLE-20 AMP. 277 VOLT-TYPE FA-B PHASE-

FY14020B 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0513 SQUARE D- BREAKER-SINGLE POLE-20 AMP. 277 VOLT-TYPE FA-A PHASE-

FY14020A 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0514 FILLER PLATE FOR A SIEMENS BREAKER-1 INCH PLATE-CATALOG # ECQF3

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0515 FILLER PLATE FOR A SQUARE D BREAKER-SQD-QOFP

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0516 RIBU1S-ENCLOSED RELAY 10 AMP-SPST-NO + OVERRIDE

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0517 RIBU1C-RIB RELAY FOR CONTROL LIGHTING

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0518 RIB2401D-RELAY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0519 4 POLE 120 VAC SQUARE D CONTACTOR

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-MISC-0520 XLR FEMALE PLUG-3 PIN-SPC11M0630-11M0630-15AMP-125 VOLT-PANEL MOUNT

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FCS Item 

Number

Item Description                                                                                              
(Including Make and Model if Applicable*)

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity 

Unit of 

Issue

Your Part 

Number

Cost               

(Per Unit of 

Issue)

Extended Cost
Your Part 

Number

Cost               

(Per Unit of 

Issue)

Extended Cost

E-PCEL-0017 PHOTO CELL TORK #2007 - FISHER PIERCE REPLACEMENT 105-285V, PLUG IN, 

RAINTIGHT 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0018 PHOTO CELL TORK #2101, 120V HEAVY DUTY 1/2" THREADS 1800W

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0166 PHOTO CELL 120V (TORK #3000) FLUSH MOUNT

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0167 PHOTO CELL TORK #2104, 208-277V HEAVY DUTY 1/2" THREADS 1800W

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0201 PHOTO CELL TORK #2002 208/277V 180 DEGREE SWIVEL 1/2" THREADS 1800W

5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0241 PHOTO CELL TORK 3002 (208/277)

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0243 120V 180 DEGREE SWIVEL MODEL #2001 PHOTO CELL-TORK

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0264 PHOTO CELL (TORK 2105) 120V SCREW IN

1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PCEL-0265 PHOTO CELL TORK 2000

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PHOTOCELL

Plates
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E-PLAT-0068 REG SS RECEPT COVER- STANDARD

5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0070 SS GFCI RECEPT COVER -STANDARD 1G

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0071 PLTC PROTECTIVE COVER SINGLE DEVICE CAT #S1961

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0072 JUMBO SS BLANK COVER-PART # SS013-LEVITON # 84114-40

9 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0074 GFI WEATHERPROOF COVER CAST ZINC-ONE GANG-HORIZONTAL-P & S-PART # 

CA26-GH 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0075 SS 2 GANG BLANK COVER-P&S SS23 

STANDARD SIZE 3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0076 JUMBO SS RECEPT COVER-1 GANG-SSO8

9 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0077 4" SQUARE 1/2" RAISED SWITCH COVER

4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0164 COVER 4" SQUARE  1900

32 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0216 BUBBLE COVER FOR EXTERIOR RECEPTACLE-SINGLE GANG-VERTICALLY OR 

HORIZONTALLY-PART # WP3100C 12 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0217 BUBBLE COVER FOR EXTERIOR RECEPTACLE-DOULBE GANG-PART # WP1020C

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0231 PLTC PROCTIVE COVER-DUPLEX DEVICE-COOPER -S1962

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0239 HANDY BOX COVER BLANK

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0246 COVER -- RECEPTACLE SS JUMBO GFCI-SS026

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0247 4 " SQUARE 1/2 RAISED RECEPTACLE

CAT. # 902 56 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0267 COVER 2 GANG WEATHER PROOF BLANK 

P & S
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0302 COVER WP RECEPTACLE HORIZONTAL 2 DOOR-P & S PART # CA8-GH

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0310 COVER-JUMBO SS 2 GANG BLANK-#SS023

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0354 COVER SWITCH-STANDARD-2 GANG-S.S. FINISH

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0375 COVER- STANDARD BLANK, 1-GANG, SS FINISH-P & S S13

8 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0376 COVER- 4 11/16 SQ. BLANK, PLAIN, GALVANIZED STEEL CITY 72-C-1 FINISH

5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0379 SS 2 DUPLEX RECEPT COVER OVERSIZE -PART # P & S  SO82-  (JUMBO ONLY)

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0382 COVER- SWITCH, STANDARD, 1-GANG, SS FINISH

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0383 COVER- SWITCH, JUMBO, 2-GANG, SS FINISH-PART # P & S S02

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0384 COVER- SWITCH, JUMBO, 1-GANG, SS FINISH

10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0385 COVER- WEATHERPROOF, 1-GANG, GFCI, COVER OPENS VERTICALLY, EAGLE 

ELECT MFG DEVICE NO. #S966-P & S  PART # CA26-GV 9 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0388 SINGLE GANG WHEATHER PROOF COVER-PART # WPB1

11 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-PLAT-0389 SS 2 DUPLEX RECEPT COVER-STANDARD SIZE PART# P & S S82

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-SOCK-0037 SOCKET- FLUORESCENT, SLIDE ON/BOLT ON QUICK WIRE, 600/660W, SLIDE ON, 

MED BI-PIN, LEVITON PN#13357N
6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOCK-0225 LAMPHOLDER, PORCELAIN, MEDIUM BASE PREWIRED-LEVITON 060-70046-000

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOCK-0226 LAMPHOLDER, PORCELAIN, MOGUL BASE, PREWIRED - LH0636 (17 INCH LEADS)

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOCK-0227 LAMPHOLDER, FLUORESCENT PEDESTAL BASE, 600W - 600V, LEVITON 13353-N-

GRAINGER PART # 5C402
9 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOCK-0229 LAMPHOLDER, FLUORESCENT PEDESTAL BASE SLIDE ON, 600W-600V LEVITON 

13551-W HO-GRAINGER PART # 6LM93
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOCK-0504 LEVITON SOCKET 13550 660W 600V PLUNGER END HO

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOCK-0506 LAMP HOLDERS-T8 ONLY-LH0611-BIPIN

19 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SOCKETS



E-SOCK-0507 LAMP HOLDER,MEDIUM,BI-PIN, RECESSED DOUBLE CONTACT 13053-UN

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-SOUN-0001 DRIVER FOR SPEAKERS-#PD60AT-ATLAS SOUND
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOUN-0002 TASCAM 160 CD PLAYER

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOUN-0003 250 WATT AMPLIFIER-BI AMP MPA-ITEM #911.8174.900

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOUN-0004 A/V WALLPLATE XLR (F) 3 PIN 1 PORT

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-SOUN-0520 XLR FEMALE PLUG-3 PIN-SPC11M0630-11M0630-15AMP-125 VOLT-PANEL MOUNT

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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E-STRA-0043 STRAP- EMT 3/4" ONE HOLE RACO #2083 (50 IN BOX)-PRICED OUT PER BOX

2 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-STRA-0046 STRAP- EMT 1/2" ONE HOLE RACO #2082

(NOTE: COMES IN BOXES OF 100) 2 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TAPE-0057 TAPE- ELECTRICAL 3M SCOTCH 33, VINYL ELECTRICAL TAPE, 3/4" X 66', BLACK

28 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TELE-0001 TELEMECANIQUE-PUSH BUTTON FOR BLEACHERS-SPRING LOADED SWITCH-ZB2-

BE101 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0178 CABLE TIES-8.0 -100 PER BAG-NOT PLENUIM

1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0179 CABLE TIES 7 3/8" LONG- MUST BE PLENUIM RATED-PLT2S-C702Y-(100 PER 

BAGS) 6 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0202 CABLE TIES 14 1/2" LONG-NOT PLENUIM RATED.

4 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0203 CABLE TIES 11 " LONG-(100 PER BAG)-THESE ARE NOT PLENUIM RATED.

1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0204 CABLE TIES-NSI-100 PER BAG-NOT PLENUIM-SIZE 5.6

1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0205 CABLE TIES-11 1/2 " LONG- PLENUIM RATED-100 PER BAG

1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0206 CABLE TIES-UV BLACK-SIZE 11.5-100 PER BAG-PLENUM RATED

1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-TIES-0207 CABLE TIES-UV BLACK-SIZE 7

2 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FCS Item 

Number

Item Description                                                                                              
(Including Make and Model if Applicable*)

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity 

Unit of 

Issue

Your Part 

Number

Cost               

(Per Unit of 

Issue)

Extended Cost
Your Part 

Number

Cost               

(Per Unit of 

Issue)

Extended Cost

E-WIRE-0092 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED WHITE (500 FT)

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0093 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED RED

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0094 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED GREEN

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0095 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED BLACK

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0096 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED BROWN

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0097 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED YELLOW-PER 500

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0098 WIRE #10 THHN STRANDED ORANGE

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0100 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED BLACK

500 FT ROLLS 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0101 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED BLUE

500 FT ROLLS 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0102 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED RED

500 FT ROLLS 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0103 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED GRAY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0104 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED YELLOW

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0105 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED BROWN

500 FT ROLLS 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

WIRE AND WIREMOLD

SOUND

SUPPLIES



E-WIRE-0106 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED GREEN

500 FT ROLLS 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0107 WIRE #12 THHN STRANDED WHITE-500 FOOT ROLLS-PRICED OUT BY THE ROLL
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0180 BONDING JUMPER #12 GAUGE WIRE (PIGTAILS)

STRANDED 100 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0219 WIRE 18/2 PLENIUM WG31141012

WHITE INTRUSION ALARM WIRE

UNSHIELDED ONLY
1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0220 WIRE 18/4 PLENIUM WG31155512

WHITE-UNSHIELDED 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0250 MC CABLE 3/8", 12-3 250 FT ROLL

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0251 MC CABLE 12/2

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0254 #10 THHN GRAY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0255 ORANGE #12 THHN

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0256 #10 THHN BLUE

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0257 TERMINAL CONNECTOR SUPPLY KIT

WIRE RANGE:22AWG-10AWG 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0258 # 6 MECHANICAL LUGS-

3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0259 RED FIRE WIRE 18/2-500 FEET BOX/ROLL

WG-45065504-SHIELDED ONLY 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0260 RED FIRE WIRE 14/2 - 500 FT. ROLLS/BOX

WG41135004 UNSHEILDED ONLY 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0261 WIRE-RG-6 QUAD SHIELD (CO-AX)-THIS WIRE IS USED WITH THE CAMERA'S-500 

FOOT ROLL- 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WIRE-0262 18/2 STRANDED PLEMIUM WIRE-WG-32145512-500 FOOT ROLL / BOX

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0131 WIREMOLD CAT #v511 STL 90 DEGREE FLAT ELBOW IVORY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0134 WIREMOLD CAT #5781 SLT BOX CONNECTOR GALV-2 PER BAG-COUNTS AS 1

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0136 WIREMOLD CAT # V504 SLT STRAP 500 IVORY

(10 PER PACK) 2 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0137 WIREMOLD CAT # V704 SLT STRAP 700 IVORY

(10 PER PACK) 1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0138 WIREMOLD CAT # V711 SLT 90 DEG FLAT ELBOW 700 IVORY

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0192 BOX WIREMOLD V5744 X DEEP SWITCH RECEPT

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0193 BOX WIREMOLD V5747 SWITCH/RECEPT SHALLOW

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0194 BOX WIREMOLD V5747-2 2 GANG SHALLOW SWITCH/RECEPT
7 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0195 STL BUSHING WIREMOLD 502 500 GALV

(BAGS-10 PER BAG) 1 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0196 WIREMOLD INSIDE ELBOW #V717

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0208 WIREMOLD POWER STRIP P/N #P6-15-PART #  26X866

47 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0247 PER FT WIRE MOLD MODEL #V500 (10ft)

4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0248 WIREMOLD INTERNAL ELBOW V-517

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0249 WIREMOLD EXTERNAL ELBOW V518

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0251 W/M BOX DEEP V5744S-(THIS MUST BE A # V5744S)

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0252 W/M BOX REG V5748

2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0253 ADJUSTABLE OFFSET CONN V5786 WIREMOLD

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E-WMOL-0506 PER FT WIRE MOLD MODEL #V700 (10ft Stick)

8 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid


